

ARSENAULT APPEAL
FILE NO. 24801 . 5MARCH 12, 2021
INVOICE NO. 11349351

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
2/01/21	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY AINSWORTH ABOUT STIPULATION.	MKB	.30	55.50
2/02/21	REVIEW DRAFT MINUTES OF EXECUTIVE SESSION; REVIEW EXISTING VILLAGE DISTRICT REGULATIONS; E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH WILLIAM WARNER; E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH WILLIAM WARNER ABOUT OTHER PROCEDURAL ASPECTS OF THE CASE; REVIEW DRAFT LEGAL NOTICE AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH WILLIAM WARNER; CHECK EXECUTIVE ORDERS.	MKB	1.70	314.50
2/05/21	REVIEW OF DRAFT OF PROPOSED STIPULATION FOR JUDGMENT; EMAIL TO ARESENAULT ATTORNEY REGARDING DRAFT.	APC	.40	74.00
2/05/21	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY AINSWORTH ABOUT SETTLEMENT OF APPEAL, EXECUTE SETTLEMENT AND SEND TO ATTORNEY AINSWORTH.	MKB	.30	55.50
2/05/21	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY AINSWORTH ABOUT FINAL STIPULATION, QUESTIONS ABOUT THE SITE PLAN, AND THE LEGAL NOTICE OF THE NEW HEARING; E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH BILL WARNER.	MKB	.80	148.00
2/09/21	EMAILS FROM/TO ARESENAULT LAWYER K. AINSWORTH.	APC	.20	37.00
2/09/21	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH BILL WARNER; REVIEW REVISED LEGAL NOTICE; E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY AINSWORTH.	MKB	.20	37.00
2/10/21	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY AINSWORTH ABOUT REVISED LEGAL NOTICE (2).	MKB	.50	92.50
2/17/21	RECEIPT/REVIEW OF SHORT CALENDAR MARKING FOR ARSENAULT REQUEST FOR TIME TO PLEAD IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO DISMISS. INTERNAL CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY M. BRANSE REGARDING REQUEST.	APC	.20	37.00
2/25/21	RECEIPT/REVIEW OF SHORT CALENDAR MARKING REQUEST FOR HADDAM MOTION TO DISMISS; EMAIL TO ATTORNEY M. BRANSE REGARDING MARKING; TRANSMITTAL OF MARKING IN LIGHT OF PROPOSED SETTLEMENT.	APC	.20	37.00
2/25/21	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT ADVISING THAT OUR MOTION TO DISMISS (101.00) WILL BE RECLAIMED TO A LATER TIME.	PP	.20	22.00
2/25/21	CORRESPONDENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL ADVISING OF AGREEMENT TO HEAR OUR MOTION TO DISMISS (101.00) AT A LATER TIME.	PP	.20	22.00
2/25/21	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH ATTORNEY AINSWORTH AND WILLIAM WARNER ABOUT MARCH 18 PUBLIC HEARING; REVIEW DRAFT MOTIONS; E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH WILLIAM WARNER.	MKB	.50	92.50
2/25/21	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH WILLIAM WARNER ABOUT VIRTUAL MEETINGS.	MKB	.30	55.50
TOTAL FEES				\$ 1,080.00
TOTAL THIS INVOICE				\$ 1,080.00

1 PERCENT PER MONTH LATE PAYMENT CHARGE WILL BE
ADDED TO ACCOUNT BALANCES 30 DAYS PAST DUE

AL LEGAL
O. 24801 . 1

HALLORAN & SAGE, LLP

MARCH 12, 2021
INVOICE NO. 11349350

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

DATE	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	ATTY	HOURS	AMOUNT
2/24/21	CORRESPONDENCE WITH W. WARNER RE: EXECUTIVE ORDERS AND REQUIREMENTS FOR REMOTE, HYBRID OR IN-PERSON MEETINGS.	RPR	.10	18.50
2/25/21	CORRESPONDENCE WITH W. WARNER AND M. BRANSE RE PUBLIC HEARING PROCEDURES UNDER EXECUTIVE ORDERS.	RPR	.10	18.50

TOTAL FEES

\$ 37.00

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 37.00

1 PERCENT PER MONTH LATE PAYMENT CHARGE WILL BE
ADDED TO ACCOUNT BALANCES 30 DAYS PAST DUE